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Criteria for the diagnosis of small pituitary ade-
noma in females presenting with amenorrhea,
galactorrhea, and hyperprolactinemia were origi-
nally presented in the radiological literature in this
article. Microsurgical removal of these small le-
sions resulted in restoration of normal serum pro-
lactin values and return to fertility. [The SC!® indi-
cates that this paper has been cited in over 185
publications, ranking it among the ten most-cited
papers ever published in this journal.1
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“Ten years ago, pathology textbooks described
pituitary adenomas arising from any of threebasic
cells, the cellular types being the chromophobes
accounting for approximately 50 percent of ade-
nomas, the acidophils accounting for 35 percent,
and the basophils accounting for the remaining 15
percent. Our article, proposing criteria for the di-
agnosis of prolactin-secreting pituitary adenomas,
was bound to disrupt these percentages, but the
impact turned out to be much greater than antici-
pated. In fact, during the last decade, and as a con-
sequence of the study of large numbers of patho-
logical specimens of the pituitary, it is now recog-
nized (hat prolactinomas account for more than
50 percent of all pituitary adenomas, leaving little
space for chromophobe tumors.

“The circumstances that came to favour thisar-
ticle were twofold. First was my privileged associa-
tion with an inventive neurosurgeon, j. Hardy, who
had pioneered microsurgery of the pituitary fossa
by the trans.sphenoidal approach. With a binocu-
lar operative microscope, Hardy could selectively
remove small pituitary adenomas white preserving
the residual pituitary gland, affording cure with-
out loss of normal pituitary functions.

“In this respect, our first radiological survey had
covered a group of 80 acromegalic patients of
whom 75 percent presented an enlarged sella on
plain films of the skull. In the remaining 25 per.
cent, a millimetric tomographic study of the sella

revealed subtle positive changes in all cases. On
this basis, we described the radiological changes
of what we called ‘microadenomas’ and presented
a classification of pituitary lesions based onsellar
findings.
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This classification is now widely used

and allows medical centers around the world to
compare methods and results of treatment of pitu-
itary adenomas in their different stages.

“The concurrent development of a biochemical
method to identify and accurately quantify the
human serum prolactin hormone with radioimmu-
noassay was the second major factor leading to
our publication. The new method, discovered in
Montr~aIby Friesen,

2
focussed considerable inter-

est on the amenorrhea-galactorrhea syndromes.
This led us to investigate a group of female pa-
tients in our infertility clinic presenting hyperpro-
lactinemia with a normal-sized sella on skull radio-
graphs. In many of these patients, the milhimetric
tomographic studies showed subtle sellar changes
somewhat similar to those seen in our acromegalic
patients. Small adenomas were selectively re-
moved and were confirmed as prolactin adenomas
by electron microscopy. In a high percentage of
these patients, we observed postoperative nor-
malization of prolactin levels and recovery of fer-
tility. -

“This Citation Classic article was a first report
and it was actually based on the tomographic
evaluation of the sella turcica in 14 female pa-
tients presenting fine radiological changes caused
by a prolactin microadenoma. These findings were
presented atthe Symposium Radiologicum in 1974
and they were published in Acta Radiologica.
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In

1977, at the First International Symposium on Pro-
lactin Hormone, we presented a series of 160 pa-
tients of whom 20 were males. As radiological
signs had become more precise, they were pro-
posed in a well-illustrated publication of the pro-
ceedings.
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In that article, we reemphasized our

original classification of pituitary adenomas with
four stages. In 1981,we published the radiological
findings and classification coveting 355 prolacti.
nomas (300 females, 55 males), introducing the
new concept of a proportional relationship be-
tween the levels of serum prolactin and the size of
the tumor.
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“The sequential articles based on the diagnostic
potential of millimetric tomography have provid-
ed indirect evidence of pituitary tumors. Recent
high resolution CT and NMR scanners have added
a considerable dimension by showing directly the
tiny intrapituitary tumor, thus confirming our
original hypothesis that patients with normal-sized
sellae can harbour a pituitary microadenoma
leading to subtle sellar findings.”
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